
  

 

   
 

 

 

 

Memo To:  All Bidders of York County Quote# 558/12-12-2023 
 

From:  Teria G. Sheffield, Procurement Director     
 

Subject:  Tabulation and Award of Quote 
 

Date: December 29, 2023 
 
Quotations were received December 12, 2023 for the purchase of Janitorial Supplies 
and has been awarded to Interstate Solutions of Rock Hill, SC. Supplies will be 
purchased on an as need basis throughout the year.   
  
This quote is effective January 1, 2024 until December 31, 2024. Tabulation is below 
for your convenience.   
 
We sincerely appreciate your response to our request for quotation and the time 
involved in submitting a response. 
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              PROCUREMENT DEPARTMENT  

6 South Congress Street, Post Office Box 180, York, South Carolina 29745-0180 
Telephone: (803) 684-8520 Fax: (803) 684-8580 Web: www.yorkcountygov.com 



12/12/2023

#1- Toilet Tissue, single ply, must measure 

4.375 x 3.75 (EXO-P96500)

Brand Name & Stock# "Green" Alternative Quantity/CS Price/EA Price/CS Samples Sent

Interstate Solutions, Rock Hill, SC NP #96100033U Yes 96 rolls x 1000 sheets  -  49.85 Qty. 2

Malor and Company Inc., New York, NY Durables Clean It Supply #F9u9111 Durables Clean It Supply #F9u9111 80  2.31  23.10 

United Sales USA Corp., Brooklyn, NY Nittany #NP-961000033U - 96  .503  48.30 

#2- Toilet Tissue, 2-ply, must measure 

4.375 x 3.75 (EXO-P96500)

Brand Name & Stock# "Green" Alternative Quantity/CS Price/EA Price/CS Samples Sent

Interstate Solutions, Rock Hill, SC Von Drehle 5022 Yes 96 rolls x 500 sheets - 41.72 Qty. 2

Malor and Company Inc., New York, NY Durables Clean It Supply FF4242 Durables Clean It Supply FF4242 80 2.51 25.10

United Sales USA Corp., Brooklyn, NY Nittany #NP-58596U - 96 .472 45.34

#3- Roll Paper Towels, Perforated 2-ply, 

(Baywest 410)

Brand Name & Stock# "Green" Alternative Quantity/CS Price/EA Price/CS Samples Sent

Interstate Solutions, Rock Hill, SC Marcal Pro #06350-12 Yes 30 rolls x 85 sheets - 21.50 Qty. 1

Malor and Company Inc., New York, NY Durables Clean It Supply VFEWE4224
Durables Clean It Supply 

VFEWE4224
40 2.01 20.19

United Sales USA Corp., Brooklyn, NY Boardwalk #BWK6272 - 30 1.025 30.74

#4- Multifold Paper Towels, Unbleached 

(SCA-MK530E)

Brand Name & Stock# "Green" Alternative Quantity/CS Price/EA Price/CS Samples Sent

Interstate Solutions, Rock Hill, SC Marcal #MFN4000 Yes 4000 count - 16.63 Qty. 2

Malor and Company Inc., New York, NY No Bid - - - -

United Sales USA Corp., Brooklyn, NY Nittany #NP-MFN4000 - 30 .604 18.12

Quote# 558- Janitorial Supplies (Samples requested per RFQ)



#5- Natural Roll Hand Towel (Tork 290088)

Brand Name & Stock# "Green" Alternative Quantity/CS Price/EA Price/CS Samples Sent

Interstate Solutions, Rock Hill, SC Essity (SCA) #290088 Yes 6 rolls x 700' - 42.84 Qty. 1

Malor and Company Inc., New York, NY Tork #290088 - 6 51.77 51.77

United Sales USA Corp., Brooklyn, NY Tork #290088 - 6 12.042 72.25

#6- Styrofoam Cups, 8 oz

Brand Name & Stock# "Green" Alternative Quantity/CS Price/EA Price/CS Samples Sent

Interstate Solutions, Rock Hill, SC Part #8J8 N/A 1000 count - 30.99

Malor and Company Inc., New York, NY No Bid - - - -

United Sales USA Corp., Brooklyn, NY Win Cup #19404229 - 8C8W - 1000 .34 33.93

#7- Mop Head, 16 oz, Rayon 4-ply

Brand Name & Stock# "Green" Alternative Quantity/CS Price/EA Price/CS Samples Sent

Interstate Solutions, Rock Hill, SC Carolina Mop #1064 N/A 12/case 3.63 43.56 Qty. 1

Malor and Company Inc., New York, NY No Bid - - - -

United Sales USA Corp., Brooklyn, NY Janico #3016 - 12 2.266 27.20

#8- Gloves- Vinyl Exam, Powder Free, 

Various Sizes

Brand Name & Stock# "Green" Alternative Quantity/CS Price/EA Price/CS Samples Sent

Interstate Solutions, Rock Hill, SC HOSPECO GLV1035-XL N/A 10 boxes of 100 1.99 19.90 Qty. 1

Malor and Company Inc., New York, NY No Bid - - - -

United Sales USA Corp., Brooklyn, NY Rensow #USEX-GV-PF - 10 3.713 37.13



#9- Gloves- Nitrile Exam, Powder Free, 6 

mil 9" cuff, latex free- (AMC-6099)

Brand Name & Stock# "Green" Alternative Quantity/CS Price/EA Price/CS Samples Sent

Interstate Solutions, Rock Hill, SC HOSPECO GLN1065-XL Yes 10 boxes of 100 3.49 34.90 Qty. 1

Malor and Company Inc., New York, NY No Bid - - - -

United Sales USA Corp., Brooklyn, NY Emerald #6100 - 10 5.98 59.80

#10- Bleach- Clorox Brand, .96 oz

Brand Name & Stock# "Green" Alternative Quantity/CS Price/EA Price/CS Samples Sent

Interstate Solutions, Rock Hill, SC Clorox #30966 N/A 3 bottles of 121 oz - 20.85

Malor and Company Inc., New York, NY No Bid - - - -

United Sales USA Corp., Brooklyn, NY Clorox #CLO30966CT - 3 7.66 22.97
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